
PLATINUM SPONSOR USD5,000 GOLD SPONSOR USD3,000 SILVER SPONSOR USD2,000

Sponsorship Opportunities 
BRATECC Cocktail Reception | Rio Oil & Gas 2022

 Recognition at event’s
opening and closing
 Company logo on all official
literature
 Eight registrations to the
Cocktail Reception
 Logo at www.braziltexas.org
for 30 days following in-
person event.
 Area to display banner at the
event
 Area to display literature and
brochures at event
 Automatically becomes a
Professional Member (see
www.braziltexas.org/members
hip for details)
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For more information about the Sponsorship Opportunities and Benefits, contact us today.

contact@braziltexas.org | julianawenzel@braziltexas.org
www.braziltexas.org  | +1.713.783.9299

 Recognition at event’s
opening and closing
 Company logo on all official
literature
 Four registrations to the
Cocktail Reception
 Logo at www.braziltexas.org
for 30 days following in-
person event.
 Area to display banner at
event
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 Recognition at event’s
opening and closing
 Company logo on all official
literature
 Two registrations to the
Cocktail Reception 
 Logo at www.braziltexas.org
for 30 days following in-person
event

1.

2.

3.

4.







